

JANITORIAL BID 2010

	JD DISTRIBUTORS	A-1 CHEMICAL	BR SUPPLY	FASTENAL	CENTRAL POLY	UNIPAK	INTERBORO
CLEANER/DEODORIZER	6.89	8.20	3.73	NO BID	*Fresh is a concentrate and other is ready to use.		
BROOMS	4.35	4.90	NO BID	NO BID	Fresh is a safer product (fire rating is 0 and		
MOP COMPOUND	4.25	3.90	4.05	7.29	lower acidity)		
TILE FLOOR WAX	9.75	9.48	10.07	17.65	*Compatible with spray buff and mop compound		
GARDEN SPRAYER	30.50	27.00	no bid	31.34			
GLASS CLEANER	4.10	3.90	NO BID	NO BID			
LIQUID HAND CLEANER	4.79	3.20	3.93	NO BID			
CLEANER /DISINFECTANT	8.62	6.25	4.80	10.27			
BATHROOM CLEANER	1.12	1.09	1.30	2.75	*Active ingredients in NABC is double the active ingredients found in Reststop.		
STRIPPER	6.39	6.15	7.56	12.38			
RUBBER GLOVES MEDIUM	0.48	0.43	NO BID	0.66			
LARGE	0.48	0.43	NO BID	0.66			
X-LARGE	0.48	0.43	NO BID	0.66			
SPRAY HEADS	0.65	0.46	NO BID	NO BID			
SPRAY MAINTAINER	5.25	6.50	4.65	NO BID			
URINAL SCREENS	1.33	0.70	NO BID	1.62			
SCRUB PADS	0.95	0.27	0.29	0.85			
SCREEN DISC	5.95	4.11	6.95	NO BID			
SHOP TOWELS	23.48	22.00	30.00	22.4			
DISP. GLOVES	4.73	3.74	3.80	5.49			
FEATHER DUSTERS	9.18	6.00	9.00	NO BID			
WET MOP W/STICK	2.69	2.50	2.89	NO BID			
WET MOP FRAME W/HANDLE	5.37	4.74	4.85	NO BID			
LAMB WOOL PADS	3.58	1.65	2.15	NO BID			
DUST MOP HANDLE	8.80	5.25	5.25	NO BID			
GYM FLOOR FINISH	16.70	18.88	27.30	NO BID	*A-1 and JD'S doesn't meet specs		
CLEANER/DEGREASER	5.35	5.10	3.90	8.38			
MOP BUCKETS	46.00	37.25	NO BID	87.81			
FLOOR POLISH	8.83	9.70	9.80	NO BID			
DUST MOP HEADS 36"	6.90	7.40	6.00	NO BID			
48"	8.25	9.45	7.96	NO BID			
72"	13.50	14.40	27.41	NO BID			
TRASH BAGS SMALL	21.00	19.47	NO BID	36.08	16.90	12.70	18.72 *Must order both sizes
LARGE	17.36	16.18	NO BID	29.90	13.95	14.40	14.98 from same vendor to get
TOILET TISSUE	32.25	33.09	NO BID	63.02	41.60		this pricing
FLOOR PADS NAT. HAIR	15.95	11.30	15.00	NO BID	*State bid pricing is cheaper		
WHITE	13.25	11.18	15.00	NO BID			
BLACK	15.95	11.30	15.00	NO BID			
GREEN	25.25	11.30	15.00	NO BID			
CARPET BONNETS	19.15	16.94	22.50	NO BID			
DUST MOP FRAMES 24"	2.07	2.05	3.32	NO BID			
36"	2.65	2.35	3.25	NO BID			
48"	3.62	3.15	3.90	NO BID			
JANITORS CART	84.99	87.45	127.00	177.16	266.10		
TERRAZZO FLOOR FINISH	9.98	9.30	25.11	NO BID	*A-1 and JD'S doesn't meet specs		
DUST PANS	3.74	1.95	2.50	3.37			
DISINFECTANT WIPES	2.41	6.50	2.50	3.37			
FACIAL TISSUE	0.68	0.45	NO BID	0.84			
ABSORBENT	40.20	23.48	NO BID	NO BID			